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Holmes, Angela

From: Frank, Kenneth
Sent: Wednesday, December 18, 2013 8:51 AM
To: Pearsall, Charles
Cc: Holmes, Angela
Subject: RE: Payout of J. Janos

Angela, please advise Council the transfer is not necessary. Charlie and Angela, please print the email and
include with the legislation (for future reference). Thanks.

From: Pearsall, Charles
Sent: Wednesday, December 18, 2013 8:19 AM
To: Frank, Kenneth
Subject: RE: Payout of J. Janos

The amount came to $64,101. $25,000 from retirement overage and the balance from your Other Loss account.

Charlie

From: Frank, Kenneth
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2013 4:23 PM
To: Pearsall, Charles
Subject: RE: Payout of J. Janos

Charlie, isn’t the amount still $65,000 +/-? Is there sufficient money in the appropriate account to make that
payment?

From: Pearsall, Charles
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2013 3:15 PM
To: Holmes, Angela
Cc: Frank, Kenneth; Kennicutt, Gerald; Tinder, Deanne
Subject: Payout of J. Janos

Angela,

Subsequent to the transfer request and legislation asking for a transfer of funds to cover this payout through the payroll
system we have taken a different approach (paid as a benefit claim with no withholdings per Sharon Janos’ attorney &
Ken’s agreement) making the transfer and legislation unnecessary. I would like to ask Council to annul/reverse Perm
Ord# 013-93. I’m not sure the process for this.

Best regards,

Charlie

Charles L. Pearsall
Comptroller/CFO
City of Binghamton
38 Hawley St
Binghamton, NY 13901-3775
607.772.7011
607.772.7106 FAX
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